
Hugues Fournel
Kayak 
Montreal, QC

 �7th place at the  
London 2012  
Olympic Games  
in the men’s  
K-2 200 metre

 �Pan American  
Champion in the  
men’s K-2 200 metre



Son of an Olympian father, Hugues was 
inspired by his family to pursue his wildest 
dreams. Since then his passion and 
dedication to his sport, combined with 
power and technique, have allowed him  
to achieve his goals at both the provincial 
and national levels, and make his Olympic 
dream a reality at the London 2012 
Olympic Games. Hugues earned a 7th 
place finish in London, and looks forward 
to competing for Canada once again at the 
Olympic Games in Rio in 2016.

Hugues is currently a student in 
Communications at UQAM and ProMédia 
in Montreal. His ultimate goal is to 
promote physical activity and to motivate 
and inspire people to believe that it is 
always possible to achieve their dreams. 

RBC® sponsors amateur sport, from 
grassroots programs in local communities 
to national sport associations and elite 
level athletes. Since 1947, RBC has been 
Canada’s longest-standing supporter of 
the Canadian Olympic Team. RBC is also  
a premier sponsor of Hockey Canada. 

rbc.com/rbcolympians

Hugues Fournel,  
RBC Olympian

® / TM Trademark(s) of Royal Bank of Canada.  
TM/MC © COC, 2013.


